



Town of Nantucket, Massachusetts  
 Procurement Office  
*Register of Bidders & Award Notice*

Bid # 2022-TON-1114  
 IFB for SUPPLYING AND DELIVERY OF MISCELLANEOUS  
 PARTS & SUPPLIES FOR THE WATER MAIN EXTENSION PROJECT

Bid Opening Time: 2:00PM, December 7, 2022  
 Department: Town Administration

BIDDERS	E.J. Prescott, Inc	F. W. Webb Company	Ferguson Waterworks	Lindon Group, Inc	Ti-Sales, Inc	C.C. Construction, Inc
PRICE BY CATEGORY	A: \$653,275.00	A: \$ No Bid	A: \$624,813.00	A: \$ No Bid	A: \$ No Bid	A: \$818,230.00
	B: \$14,500.00	B: \$ No Bid	B: \$13,930.00	B: \$ No Bid	B: \$ No Bid	B: \$16,475.00
	C: \$29,209.00	C: \$ No Bid	C: \$21,350.83	C: \$ No Bid	C: \$ No Bid	C: \$34,055.60
	D: \$68,745.00	D: \$68,328.82	D: \$76,962.14	D: \$80,090.73	D: \$ No Bid	D: \$96,360.15
	E: \$10,019.00	E: \$ No Bid	E: \$14,654.37	E: \$13,922.03	E: \$14,671.12	E: \$19,515.80
	F: \$1,724.00	F: \$ No Bid	F: \$1,263.21	F: \$ No Bid	F: \$ No Bid	F: \$8,163.30
	G: \$82,539.00	G: \$75,330.00	G: \$85,057.56	G: \$87,284.52	G: \$103,437.54	G: \$104,059.35
	H: \$61,794.00	H: \$ No Bid	H: \$71,208.08	H: \$ No Bid	H: \$73,566.32	H: \$102,530.40
	I: \$79,650.00	I: \$ No Bid	I: \$96,551.70	I: \$ No Bid	I: \$82,169.85	I: \$ No Bid

**Award Made To:**

E.J. Prescott, Inc (Category E, H & D) & Ferguson Waterworks (Category A, B, C & F)

The F.W. Webb Company (Category D & G)

Assistant Procurement Officer:

  
 Alice M. Kellogg

Date: 1/15/23